

PUBLIC SERVICE BOARD MEETING AGENDA ITEM REGULAR MEETING

Wednesday, June 08, 2022

SUBJECT

Bid Number 56-22, Hydrogen Chloride

BACKGROUND

Hydrogen Chloride is used to clean the diffusers inside the aeration basins to improve air transfer, thus improving efficiency at the John T. Hickerson Water Reclamation Facility and the Haskell R. Street Wastewater Treatment Plant.

The previous bid was awarded on January 23, 2020. This bid is 52% higher than the previous bid.

STRATEGIC OBJECTIVES SUPPORTED

Improve Efficiency

EVALUATION PROCESS

EPWater received one bid on April 7, 2022, from SYOXSA, Inc. Staff evaluated the sole bidder and has determined that SYOXSA, Inc. met all the requirements as outlined within the bid proposal.

FINANCIAL IMPLICATIONS

Sufficient funds are available in Account Number 7500, and the funding source is the Water and Sewer Fund.

PROPOSED ACTION REQUESTED

Consider and award Bid Number 56-22, Hydrogen Chloride, to SYOXSA, Inc. to the sole responsive, responsible bidder, in the estimated annual amount of \$134,000 for a term of one year with the option for two, one-year extensions, provided that funding is available in the approved budget.

SUPPORTING DOCUMENTATION PROVIDED

• Bid tab

PUBLIC SERVICE BOARD-EL PASO WATER UTILITIES

TABULATION OF BIDS FOR: HYDROGEN CHLORIDE

BID OPENING: April 7, 2022 at 11:00 AM

BID NUMBER: 56-22

Prepared By:

Reviewed By:_

Date: 5/23/22

		*			Previous Bid 01/23/2020		SYOXSA, INC.	UNIVAR USA, INC.
1754	DECODIDATION	OTV					6996 Commerce Ave.	8201 S. 212th
ITEM	DESCRIPTION	QTY	1 14 117	Φ.	0.407.50	•	El Paso, TX 79915	Kent, WA 98032
1	HYDROGEN CHLORIDE	8	UNIT	\$	8,437.50		10,000.00	
	TECHNICAL SIZE Y 600 LB CYLINDER	CYL	ITEM 1 TOTAL	\$	67,500.00	\$	80,000.00	NO BID
2	2 HYDROGEN CHLORIDE	4	MO. FEE	\$	420.00	\$	1,000.00	
	TECHNICAL SIZE Y 600 LB.	CYL	MO. TOTAL FEE	\$	1,680.00	\$	4,000.00	
	CYLINDER		YRLY RENTAL FEE	\$	20,160.00	\$	48,000.00	
			ITEM 2 TOTAL	\$	20,160.00	\$	48,000.00	NO BID
3	CYL HAZMAT FREIGHT PICK-	8	UNIT	\$	10.00	\$	250.00	
	UP CHARGE	CYL	ITEM 3 TOTAL	\$	80.00	\$	2,000.00	NO BID
4	4 CYL. HAZMAT FREIGHT	8	UNIT	\$	25.00	\$	500.00	
	DELIVERY CHARGE	CYL	ITEM 4 TOTAL	\$	200.00	\$	4,000.00	NO BID
	TOTAL BID (ITEMS 1-4)			\$	87,940.00	\$	134,000.00	NO BID
			DISCOUNT: PAYMENT TERMS:				RESIDENT BIDDER 0.00% NET 30 DAYS	NONRESIDENT BIDDER